
[118H8635] 

..................................................................... 

(Original Signature of Member) 

119TH CONGRESS 
1ST SESSION H. R. ll 

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to double the value of certain 

tax benefits relating to children and dependents. 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Ms. DAVIDS of Kansas introduced the following bill; which was referred to the 

Committee on llllllllllllll 

A BILL 
To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to double 

the value of certain tax benefits relating to children 

and dependents. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-1

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 2

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 3

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Affordable Child Care 4

Act’’. 5

SEC. 2. CHILD AND DEPENDENT CARE CREDIT DOUBLED. 6

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 21(c) of the Internal Rev-7

enue Code of 1986 is amended— 8

VerDate Nov 24 2008 11:44 Jan 16, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\KGHAUFF\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\DAVIKS_006
January 16, 2025 (11:44 a.m.)

G:\M\19\DAVIKS\DAVIKS_006.XML

g:\VHLD\011625\D011625.012.xml           (963394|1)



2 

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘‘$3,000’’ and 1

inserting ‘‘$6,000’’, and 2

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘‘$6,000’’ and 3

inserting ‘‘$12,000’’. 4

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section 21 of such 5

Code is amended by striking subsection (g) and redesig-6

nating subsection (h) as subsection (g). 7

(c) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by 8

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after 9

December 31, 2024. 10

SEC. 3. DEPENDENT CARE ASSISTANCE PROGRAM LIMIT 11

DOUBLED. 12

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 129(a)(2) of the Internal 13

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— 14

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking ‘‘$5,000 15

($2,500’’ and inserting ‘‘$10,000 (half such dollar 16

amount)’’, and 17

(2) by striking subparagraph (D). 18

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by 19

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after 20

December 31, 2024. 21

VerDate Nov 24 2008 11:44 Jan 16, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\KGHAUFF\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\DAVIKS_006
January 16, 2025 (11:44 a.m.)

G:\M\19\DAVIKS\DAVIKS_006.XML

g:\VHLD\011625\D011625.012.xml           (963394|1)



3 

SEC. 4. EMPLOYER-PROVIDED CHILDCARE CREDIT DOU-1

BLED. 2

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 45F(b) of the Internal 3

Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking ‘‘$150,000’’ 4

and inserting ‘‘$300,000’’. 5

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by 6

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after 7

December 31, 2024. 8

VerDate Nov 24 2008 11:44 Jan 16, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00003 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\KGHAUFF\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\DAVIKS_006
January 16, 2025 (11:44 a.m.)

G:\M\19\DAVIKS\DAVIKS_006.XML

g:\VHLD\011625\D011625.012.xml           (963394|1)



....................................................


(Original Signature of Member)


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to double the value of certain tax benefits relating to children and dependents.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Ms. Davids of Kansas introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________




A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to double the value of certain tax benefits relating to children and dependents.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Affordable Child Care Act”. 


SEC. 2. Child and dependent care credit doubled.

(a) In general.—Section 21(c) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— 


(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “$3,000” and inserting “$6,000”, and


(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “$6,000” and inserting “$12,000”. 


(b) Conforming amendment.—Section 21 of such Code is amended by striking subsection (g) and redesignating subsection (h) as subsection (g). 

(c) Effective date.—The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 

SEC. 3. Dependent care assistance program limit doubled.

(a) In general.—Section 129(a)(2) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— 

(1) in subparagraph (A), by striking “$5,000 ($2,500” and inserting “$10,000 (half such dollar amount)”, and


(2) by striking subparagraph (D).


(b) Effective date.—The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 

SEC. 4. Employer-provided childcare credit doubled.

(a) In general.—Section 45F(b) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking “$150,000” and inserting “$300,000”.

(b) Effective date.—The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024.





  
    G:\M\19\DAVIKS\DAVIKS_006.XML XXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX 1/16/2025 11:44 XXXXXXX 01/16/2025 11:42 AM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXX   963394|1  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [118H8635] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Ms. Davids of Kansas introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on ______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to double the value of certain tax benefits relating to children and dependents. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Affordable Child Care Act. 
  2. Child and dependent care credit doubled
  (a) In general Section 21(c) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended—
  (1) in paragraph (1), by striking  $3,000 and inserting  $6,000, and
  (2) in paragraph (2), by striking  $6,000 and inserting  $12,000. 
  (b) Conforming amendment Section 21 of such Code is amended by striking subsection (g) and redesignating subsection (h) as subsection (g). 
  (c) Effective date The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 
  3. Dependent care assistance program limit doubled
  (a) In general Section 129(a)(2) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended—
  (1) in subparagraph (A), by striking  $5,000 ($2,500 and inserting  $10,000 (half such dollar amount), and
  (2) by striking subparagraph (D).
  (b) Effective date The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 
  4. Employer-provided childcare credit doubled
  (a) In general Section 45F(b) of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by striking  $150,000 and inserting  $300,000.
  (b) Effective date The amendments made by this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after December 31, 2024. 
 


